




















































































Eric C. Winters 
Attorney at Law 

 
 

TELEPHONE  503-454-0828    30710 SW Magnolia Avenue 

FAX  866-867-5451    Wilsonville, Oregon 97070 

 
Tax ID #541069933     Eric@ericwinters.com    

 

INVOICE AND BILLING STATEMENT 
 

 

Clackamas County Chair John Ludlow 

       Statement date:   7/2/14 

 

 

RE:  Outside counsel assignment - Jared Anderson employment complaint 

 

 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES PROVIDED 

 

Legal Fees           

        

5-6-14  Call fr. John Ludlow re: assistance in   2.5 hrs ($175)    

assignment of outside  counsel, rev. complaint,  

assemble list, call to D. Angeli, Prep for  

meeting  

 

5-7-14  Travel to Clackamas Co. offices (38 mi rndtrp) 0.8 hr ($75) 

 

5-7-14  Conference w. John, Angeli and B. Souede  1.4 hrs ($175) 

 

5-8-14  Angeli call re: conflict, call to John, multiple  1.8 hrs ($175)  

  calls re: counsel interviews 

 

5-9-14  Travel to R. Hoevet’s office (43mi rndtrp)  1.0 hr ($75) 

 

5-9-14  Conference w. W. Boise, Hoevet and John re: 0.9 hr ($175) 

  assignment of counsel 

 

5-13-14  Call fr. John      0.4 hr (No Charge) 

 

5-16-14  Review investigator summary interview w. John 0.3 hr (No Charge) 

 

5-20-14  Review Ludlow interview notes   0.2 hr (No Charge) 

 

5-21-14  Review Hoevet redline of summary   0.2 hr (No Charge) 



 

5-28-14  Review public records request, emails w. John 0.4 hr (No Charge) 

 

5-29-14  Call fr. John requesting my assignment as counsel, 0.8 hr ($175) 

  Emails fr. John, call to S. Ruckwardt 

 

5-30-14  Call to John, rev. S. Madkour email re: release of  0.5 hr ($175) 

  doc’s process 

 

6-2-14  Travel to Clackamas Co. offices (38 mi rndtrp) 0.8 hr ($75) 

 

6-2-14  Meet w. John; meeting with N. Drury,   2.2 hrs ($175) 

  K. Rastetter and John; Confer w. Madkour,  

  partial review of investigative documents,  

  meet w. John 

 

6-2-14  Legal research re: public records, call to John, 1.5 hrs ($175) 

  Call to Ruckwardt, memo to John 

 

6-3-14  Travel to Clackamas Co. offices (38 mi rndtrp) 0.8 hr ($75) 

 

6-3-14  Meet w. John, meeting with Madkour, finish  2.0 hrs ($175) 

  review of investigative reports  

 

6-3-14  Meet w. John, T. Smith and Ruckwardt; rev.  2.3 hrs ($175)    

  caselaw, meet w. Madkour and Ruckwardt,  

  meet w. John 

 

6-3-14  Call fr. John, memo fr. Madkour, call to  1.4 hrs ($175) 

  Ruckwardt, call to John   

 

6-4-14  Memo to John, call to Ruckwardt, email fr.   1.8 hrs ($175) 

  Ludlow, review doc’s to be released, memo’s 

  Ruckwardt 

 

6-6-14  Review media coverage, memo to John  0.4hr (No Charge) 

 

6-11-14  Review media coverage, call to John   0.8hr (No Charge) 

  

     

 Subtotal fees and expenses 

   

  $3342.50 19.1 hrs legal work billed @ $175/hr 

  $  255.00 3.4 hrs of travel billed @ $75/hr 

  $      0.00 2.7 hrs unbilled client communications, materials review 

  $    78.50 157 miles billed @ $0.50/mi 

 



 

 

 

TOTAL FEES AND EXPENSES      $3676.00 

 

Please remit payment to:  Eric C. Winters 

    30710 SW Magnolia Avenue 

    Wilsonville, Oregon 97070   

 


